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It is very difficult to write about the homeland.  It is 

impossible to feel the Homeland without feeling the 
Homeland in the heart.  It is sometimes said that a 

person who works in another country knows the value 
of the homeland.  In fact, even a person who truly 

loves his homeland while living in it can fully 

understand the dignity of the country.In order to feel 
the homeland deeply in the heart, it is necessary to 

know, respect, appreciate and strengthen the 
examples of patriotism of the people. These feelings, 

these beautiful high human qualities are a true 
example of patriotism for our free day.  That is, the 

nation is the pillar of the Motherland. A sense of 

homeland means to love, be proud of, respect and 
appreciate one's people.  It means not to forget our 

great compatriot scholars, thinkers, sultans of hadith 
and mysticism, who made a great contribution to the 

development of the world with their minds and 

intellects.  The feeling of homeland means to live with 
high faith in our dear and beautiful country and to 

always be a true child to it.  it is impossible not to miss 
it when it is far away. Only… Another difficulty in 

writing about the homeland is that often one cannot 

find a word to applaud or describe what one loves 
from the heart.  Therefore, I would like to see love 

and respect for the Motherland silently, first of all, in 
practice, in the good deeds done.I thought that the 

homeland is a handful of soil.  Later I realized that 
there is a lot of wisdom in this handful of soil and that 

nothing can be exchanged for my grandmother's 

yard… Today, as I write about my homeland, I 
remember those moments.  I can't help but think that 

Uzbekistan is my homeland - my homeland! We have 
no right to betray the country where we were born 

and raised! I discovered that the homeland begins on 

the threshold of the wonderful days of my childhood. 
And again, these are kind people around us who teach 

us to love and respect our country!  The human child 
is thirsty for love for a lifetime.  An invisible bond 

encourages us to live side by side with good people, to 

work hard, and to strive for a hot and exciting 
life…The homeland is a sacred place where human 

blood is shed.  Independence is the return of your 
place, your glory, your freedom, your mother tongue, 

your national history, your religion, your identity!  It's 
not just high-sounding words.  It is a call to the mind 

and heart of every person who was born and raised in 

this country, who ate and drank the water of this 
country!Homeland begins at the threshold.  When a 

person is born, his duty and duty to his homeland will 
be with him.  Everyone should live their life not as 

“what the homeland gave me” but as “what I gave to 

my homeland”. The child senses the external 
environment from the mother's womb.  According to 

experts, it is useful for a pregnant woman to read 
more about different countries.  It is also expedient for 

us to instill in the unborn child the love for the 

motherland before it is actually born. They compare 
the homeland to the mother.  We have come across 

the phrase “motherland” very often in many literatures.  
How holy our mother is to us.  "Paradise under the 

feet of mothers," they say.  Our lives are short enough 
to pay off the debt that our mothers have given 

us.Motherland is a priceless treasure for a person.  The 

existence of the homeland gives a person unparalleled 
strength and power.  This feeling is deeply ingrained in 

people's hearts.  That is why there is a man who loves 
and respects his Homeland and does not exchange it 
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for any wealth. To know the homeland is to know 

oneself, to understand how each person is connected 
to the whole of humanity. The homeland is one, so it 

is sacred. The only thing is to respect the homeland, 
the mother, the sky, the sun ... In many ways, we 

compare the homeland with the mother. Because in 

this world, we cannot find anyone greater than our 
respected mother. This is our second home, our place 

of worship.The word homeland always goes hand in 
hand with the word mother.  It’s just quality, not the 

usual metaphor.  The homeland is in harmony with the 

mother who created such a miracle as human birth.  
The homeland is a place of miracles in the destiny of a 

human being like a mother.  That is why the two 
miracles are called side by side.  The more a person 

sacrifices for his mother, the more he cares for her, 
respects her, loves her, cares for her, protects her 

from various disasters and enemies.  If necessary, he 

will sacrifice his life for the Motherland.  If Munis and 
the venerable Mother bring a person into this bright 

world, the Motherland will bring him up in the sphere 
of life, raise him, show him as a person.  Therefore, 

there is no place for a person greater, more honorable 

and more valuable than the Motherland.Moreover,the 
feeling of love for the motherland enters the 

bloodstream through breast milk. This sacred feeling is 
brought up by the mother goddess.The feeling of 

homeland enters everyone's blood with the mother 

goddess, poems and songs that she heard as a child.  
When a sense of patriotism is formed from infancy, it 

lasts forever.Patriotism is the most important 
component of the moral formation of an individual.  

That is why when a child's sense of patriotism is 
formed from infancy, it lasts forever.  Therefore, it is 

advisable to combine the following in each person 

from an early age.Loyalty is the devotion and courage 
that comes from understanding a person homeland, 

his duty to those who believe in him and those who 
love him. There is no one in this world who does not 

love and dream of his homeland, his homeland.  he 

leaves his homeland.  Loyalty and devotion in the 
human heart come from love for ones  homeland.  

 After all, independence has opened a wide way for us 
to determine our own destiny, to do great things today 

and tomorrow.  It gave back our will, our religion, our 
history.  We have become free to express ourselves.  

Thankfully, the great creative and renewal changes 

that have taken place in our country over the past 
three years have changed the lives and thoughts of 

each of us.  We have learned to work for a truly bright 
country with a bright future. Change is everywhere.  

Every province, city, district and mahalla is fighting for 

prosperity.  Great achievements are being made in our 

country.  This does not happen by itself.  Nothing 
happens by itself.  No one will come and create good 

conditions for us.  Therefore, every citizen of our 
country should contribute to the great and noble 

deeds carried out by the President of our country.The 

homeland is the land where the ancestors lived, where 
the people grew up, where its language, history, 

culture, customs and values are formed, grow and 
develop.  It is the childhood duty of each of us to 

cherish it.  At a time when globalization is taking place 

in the world today, there are also some worrying 
processes, such as the spread of ideas that promote 

statelessness and bigotry.  At the same time, one of 
the most important tasks before us is to educate the 

younger generation in the spirit of devotion to the 
motherland.  it is necessary to awaken and form in 

them the ideas of acquaintance, understanding of the 

homeland, national pride, knowledge of the history of 
the homeland.It is difficult to imagine the homeland 

without the people. The most important thing in 
achieving independence is the ability of our people to 

persevere in the pursuit of their goals based on their 

patience, wisdom, tolerance, diligence and creativity.  
It is necessary to rely on such immortal values as 

spirituality, morality, enlightenment in inculcating 
patriotism in the youth.  These three great values have 

always been respected by our people for centuries.  

Both our sacred religion and the philosophy of the 
whole East glorified these values, considering them the 

most important conditions for social development. 
 The motherland is compared to the mother In many 

literatures, the phrase "motherland" is often used.  
How holy our mother is to us.  The hadith also says, 

"Paradise is under the feet of mothers."  Our lives are 

not enough to pay off the debt that our mothers have 
given us for so long.  A mother is not only physically 

but also mentally exhausted to give birth to her child.  
Our holy religion, Islam, also emphasizes our duty to 

mothers.  Our duty and duty to our mother must be in 

harmony with our love for the Motherland.  We were 
born and raised in this dear Motherland, let's do our 

best for the development of our Motherland.  We feel 
it is our duty to love him and cherish him like the apple 

of our eye. In some lands, marital discord is the order 
of the day.  This evil has not bypassed our country.  As 

a result, babies are becoming orphans.  This has a 

serious impact on the future of children.  It is obvious 
that an orphaned child is mentally retarded and people 

of different purposes try to fill the gap.  Let's fill this 
gap in the spirit of patriotism.  Let's be kind to each 

other.  Let the children see the love in the family and 
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give their love to their homeland.  In conclusion, we 

would like to emphasize that this dear and sacred 
Motherland is inherited from you and our ancestors.  

Therefore, it is the sacred duty of all of us to do our 
best for the development of the Motherland, to 

sacrifice our lives for the protection of the 

Motherland.In conclusion, I would like to emphasize 
that this dear and holy homeland was not built for us 

yesterday or today.  This sacred homeland is inherited 
from great ancestors.  Therefore, it is the duty of all of 

us to make our contribution to the development of the 

country as much as possible.  It was when I was able 
to make a small change in the life of my country 

through this checkpoint.  For me, this would be the 
region of greatest happiness. 
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